VENDOR INFORMATION

WSD SCHOOL BUS PARTS AND TRUCK PARTS 2022
Pricing Firm 9/1/2022 - 6/30/2023

Company/Address Contact/Phone/Fax/Email Minimum order Pay Company wel Guaranteed Delivery; Times Contract Type Rebate |Other Oakland |Familial Iran Spec
Terms orders must be placed by; Phone |Form County School |Relationship |[Compliance [Sheet
Districts Disclosure Form
A Parts Warehouse Molly Enright $99 + for free shipping Net 30; |apartswarehouse.com Delivered within 24 hours if Fixed-Price None Yes Yes Yes Yes
1801 Waldon Road Phone: 248-391-2300 Accepts Order placed by 2:00 PM Contract with
Lake Orion, Ml 48359 Fax: 248-391-2301 P-Card Same Day Urgent Economic Price
molly@apartswarehouse.com Call All Staff Adjustments
Phone: 1-800-409-5211
A-1Truck Parts Michael Goldman None Net 30; |autowares2020.com Delivered within 24 hours if Fixed-Price None  [Yes Yes Yes Yes
23 East Walton Blvd Phone:248-867-6000 Accepts Order placed by 3:00 PM Contract with
Pontiac, MI 48340 Fax: 248-333-3810 P-Card Call Mike Goldman Economic Price
mikeg@autowares.com Phone: 248-867-6000 Adjustments
C & S Motor, Inc. Matt Ashworth Supplier-Dependent 10th/ tricotruck.com Delivered within 48 hours if Fixed-Price None Yes Yes Yes No
113 S. Dort Hwy Phone: 810-234-5686 month; Order placed by 8:30 AM Contract with
Flint, MI 48503 Fax: 810-239-0083 Accepts 24 hr Urgent Economic Price
(Tri-County) Cell: 810-348-7733 P-Card Call Matt Ashworth Adjustments
mashworth@tricotruck.com Phone: 810-234-5686
Cummins, Inc. Nick Kantola None Net 30; |cummins.com Delivered within 48 hours if Fixed-Price None No Yes Yes Yes
54250 Grand River Avenue Phone: 810-623-5567 Accepts Order placed by 2:00 PM Contract with
Lyon Charter Twp., Ml 48165 nicholas.kantola@cummins.com P-Card Call Nick Kantola Economic Price
(Cummins Sales & Service) Phone: 810-623-5567 Adjustments
Jackson Truck Service Phil Fischmeister None Net 30; |jtsmi.com Delivered within 24 hours if Fixed-Price None  [Yes Yes Yes Yes
1183 Lewis St. Phone: 517-783-6342 or Accepts Order placed by 9:00 AM Contract with
P.O. Box 1362 Phone: 517-745-9610 P-Card Same Day Urgent Economic Price
Jackson, MI 49204 pmfischmeister@jtsmi.com Call Phil Fischmeister Adjustments
Phone: 517-783-6342
Midwest Transit Equipment Sadie Morales None Net 30; |midwesttransit.com Delivered 24-48 hours if order Fixed-Price None No Yes Yes Yes
15580 US Hwy 27 N Phone: 800-487-9782 ext 1285 Accepts placed by 11:00 AM Contract with
Marshall, MI 49068 sadiemorales@midwesttransit.com P-Card Same Day Urgent Economic Price
Call MTE Parts Hotline Adjustments
Phone: 866-487-9782
State Wire and Terminal, Inc. Joe DeBrincat $50 Min. Net 30; |statewire.com Delivered within 24 hours if Fixed-Price None Yes Yes Yes Yes
2676 Paldan Drive Phone: 248-634-2020 NO Order placed by 1:00 PM Contract
Auburn Hills, Ml 48326-1824 Fax: 248-634-2022 P-Card Same Day Urgent
joed@statewire.com Stephanie Hinze-Dudek
Phone: 248-634-2020
sdudek@statewire.com
Unity School Bus Parts Ryan Valla None Net 30; |unityparts.com Delivered within 24-48 hours Fixed-Price None Yes Yes Yes Yes
21280 Carlo Drive Phone: 1-800-937-3906 Accepts Same Day Urgent Contract with
Clinton Twp., Ml 48038 Fax: 810-765-2835 P-Card Ryan Valla Economic Price
rvalla@unityparts.com Phone: 1-800-937-3906 Adjustments




WSD - SCHOOL BUS AND TRUCK PARTS

FY 2022-2023

Complete TABULATION Corrected
Type Part Number Part Description No Bid | APARTSWH| A-1 TRUCK [ CUMMINS | JACKSON MIDWEST STATE WIRE UNITY C&STRI
SQLLESILEL? 1231MF Battery ! 1231MF Battery Battery $ 121.74
Type Part Number Part Description APARTS WH| A-1 TRUCK | CUMMINS | JACKSON MIDWEST STATE WIRE UNITY C&S TRI
BELTS 5270678 / GAT38702 Belt Tensioner Cummins C $ 162.80 [ $ 90.64 $ 129.77
10023152 / GAT38329 Tensioner Belt Air Comp B $ 67.29
10042726 / 10042726 Air Belt BB No Bid
3866104C1 / 3866104C1 Belt S 35.02 S 23.03
DOR 419-109 / DOR 419-109 Tensioner GMC 6.0 2007 $ 38.33 $ 26.93
DOR 419-112 / DOR 419-112 Tensioner GMC 6.0 2007 S 38.88 S 29.42
GAT 38158 / GAT38158 Tensioner A/C 07 GMC 2500 $ 38.88 $ 39.30
GAT K040378 / GAT K040378 Belt Serpentine 2007 GMC S 16.89 S 17.04
GAT K060930 / GAT K060930 Belt Serpentine 2007 GMC $ 27.08 $ 41.65
Type Part Number Part Description APARTSWH| A-1 TRUCK | CUMMINS | JACKSON MIDWEST ALT STATE WIRE UNITY C&STRI
BRAKES 10032931 / HD32M Drum Front BB 2017 $ 262.25
18126 / 3572290C1 Hose Air Brk Swl - Fixed $ 9.32 $ 16.36
682066 / 682066 Hose Brake Line 3/8 Swivel No Bid
801526 / 801526 Parking Knob Grip $ 14.86 $ 15.29
802744 / 802744 Valve $ 32.01 $ 65.47
10032910 / 10 Brake Drum Rear B/B $ 132.00 $ 175.20
25879231 / 25879231 Modulator Value Van GMC 2500 $ 310.76
0066351 / BX065661 B/B Parking Brake Valve $ 149.36 $ 147.29 | $ 161.33
2605073C1 / 3757X Drum Rear IC Bluebird $ 183.08 $ 229.09
2605074C1 / FLT4421B Drum Front $ 166.47 $ 207.34| S 177.07
3030 Long Chamber  / BXNT3030ELSWC Chamber Rear 30x30 $ 80.87 $ 67.72 $ 81.79
30 30 Long Chamber  / NT3030ELS Chamber Rear $ 61.78 $ 60.49
472195 094 0 / 472195 094 0 Valve ABS Frt C2 $ 131.85
4721950950 / 472 195095 0 Valve ABS Frt C2 $ 134.10
52-7393 / 52-7393 Hydroboost GMC 2500 2010 $ 19555
89X17307A / 89X17307A Caliper Front Right GMC 2500 $ 51.22
89X17307B / 89X17307B Caliper Front Left GMC 2500 $ 51.22
BR5507202 / BR5507202 Rotor Front GMC 2500 2010 $ 82.61
BX K058715 / BX K058715 Chamber Front T20 $ 44.80
BX801315 / BX801315 Valve Park Brake Dash IC $ 170.86 $ 159.47 $ 180.43
DRUM 3800X / DRUM 3800X Brake Drum Inter $ 164.02 $ 172.69 $ 212.83
GUN 3600AX / 3600AX Rear Drums C-2 Bluebird $ 137.78 $ 132.00 S 170.02
OEX784 / OEX784 Pads Brake Front GMC 2500 $ 48.62 $ 42.25
PKSMA2124707QP | PKSMA2124707QP Brake Shoe Rear 16.5x7 $ 42.95 S 105.30
Type Part Number Part Description APARTSWH| A-1 TRUCK | CUMMINS | JACKSON MIDWEST ALT  |STATEWIRE UNITY C&STRI
ELECTRICAL 2599051 / 2599051 Heater Control $ 3.55 $ 5.70
10006555 / 10006555 Horn Brush BB S 27.86
10006555 / K034343 Horn Brush BB $ 27.86
10010644 / 10010644 Alt BB S 557.63
10015829 / 10015829 Contact Plate Horn BB $ 36.29
10019603 / 10019603 Starter BB 6.8 Propane No Bid
454996001 / 454996001 Switch Air Door in Dash S 40.23
007120-7K / 007120-7K Stop Arm Module Pick Up S 262.16
240-12041 / 240-12041 Soft Start Solnoid No Bid
24-146045 / 5014 Motor, Specialty Stop Arm $ 164.11 S 159.14
24-285020 / 24-285020 Horn Fits Buses Duel Hig No Bid
256 TSL-C Stobe /  256TSL-C Stobe Strobe Light $ 69.89
4022171C92 / 4022171C92 Alt Pad Mount 240amp IC $ 355.42
4049850C92 / 4049850C92 Horn S 71.95
ECV7561STT-FA |/ ECVT7561STT-FA 7" Stop Tail Light S 52.34 $ 28.71
RY612 / RY612 Relay Heat No Bid




[ TBB61201817 /23132650001 | Relay Heat C2 [ B 18.25
Type Part Number Part Description APARTSWH| A-1TRUCK | CUMMINS | JACKSON MIDWEST STATE WIRE UNITY C&STRI
ENGINE 2871960 / 2871960 Sensor Diff Pressure $ 191.84 [ $ 143.20 $ 152.90 $ 93.61
2881692 / 5566893 Kit Cooler Egr 2011-2015 $ 995.94 $ 793.93
2881692 / 6700125 Kit Cooler Egr 2011-2015 $ 995.94
5473229RX / 5473229RX Kit Egr Valve No Bid
5601240NX / 5601240NX Turbo Actutator $  1,707.59 $  1,356.74
DOR 977-000 / DOR 977-000 Throttle Pos GMC 2007 S 100.86
MRD 523-190 / MRD 523-190 Thermostat GMC 2500 6.0 $ 12.40
TH445 / TH445 Sensor Throttle Postion 0 S 46.63
Type Part Number Part Description APARTSWH| A-1 TRUCK | CUMMINS | JACKSON MIDWEST STATE WIRE UNITY | casTri
EXHAUST 33286 / 17400 Clamp Wrap 4" Preformed $ 15.50 $ 27.05
2871861 / 2871861 Clamp V Band DPF S 52.00 S 85.18 | S 67.23 S 85.86
3866337 / 3866337 Gasket AFM Device No Bid
5447591 / 5447591 Gasket Exhaust Manifold C S 8.20 S 6.07
F121A / F121A Pipe Turbo C2 $ 395.00 $ 389.00
F121B / F121B Pippe Turbo C2 DPF Inlet S 305.00 S 299.00
TBB61230632 / 147921 Hanger Tail Pipe C2 $ 13.76 $ 10.01
WAL 31574 / WAL 31574 Gasket Muffler to Frt Pipe No Bid
WAL 35229 / 16271 Hanger Exh GM Rubber 2 HO No Bid
Type Part Number Part Description APARTSWH| A-1 TRUCK | CUMMINS | JACKSON ALT MIDWEST ALT STATE WIRE UNITY C&S TRI
FILTERS 33812 / 33812 Fuel Filter $ 21.74 S 36.71
33965 / 33965 Fuel Filter $ 21.89 FS1065 $ 20.84
42809 / 42809 Air Filter $ 38.24 S 38.55
49519 / 49519 Air Filter $ 31.98 AF25188 | $ 31.76
57182 / 57182 Oil Filter $ 6.98 LF3970 |3 6.96
63000 / 63000 Filter $ 20.40 $ 25.38
3199076 / 22-62199-000 Filter Heater C2 8-25/64 No Bid
109493X / 109493X Air Dryer s 8527 e | pimiosss s 8456
BF63000 / BF63000 Fuel Filter $ 20.40 5 25.38
FS 1098 / FS 1098 Filter $ 99.32 [ $ 76.94
PF2232 / PF2232 Oil Filter $ 5.64 S 6.39
PF-61 / PF-61 QOil Filter $ 3.18 S 4.27
PF63E / 12690385 Oil Filter $ 3.18 $ 3.61
WA 10804 / WA 10804 Air Filter $ 3.30 AF4222 S 89.71
WIX 49902 / WIX 49902 Air Filter $ 15.01 5 15.56
WIX 57060 / WIX 57060 Filter Oil GMC 6.2 $ 3.12 LF16242 [$ 3.10
WI1X57045 / WI1X57045 Oil Filter S 3.10 S 3.27
WIX57701 / WIX57701 Trans Filter $ 10.86 HF35296 | S 10.62
Type Part Number Part Description APARTSWH| A-1 TRUCK | CUMMINS | JACKSON MIDWEST STATE WIRE UNITY C&S TRI
GASKET 2871451 / 2871451 Gasket DPF Filter S 40.15 | $ 34.10 S 32.02
3978072 / 3978072 Gasket Intake Cummins $ 534 |$ 3.94 $ 3.88
4932615 / 4932615 Gasket EGR Conn S 428 | S 3.20 S 3.10
5253019 / 5253019 EGR Exh Gasket $ 14.13 [ $ 10.74 $ 10.43
5402022 / 5402022 Gasket Exhaust Manifold C $ 16.58 | $ 11.93 $ 12.35
Type Part Number Part Description APARTS WH| A-1TRUCK | CUMMINS | JACKSON MIDWEST ALT STATE WIRE UNITY C&STRI
HEATERS 75843 / 75843 Blower Motor GMX No Bid
756720 / 1000202056 Fan Defrost Dash All $ 57.29 $ 43.89 $ 43.92
2099019 / 2099019 Resistor $ 5.74 S 30.41 S 7.50
3199067 / 3199067 Heater Filter C2 8 1/4x1 S 86.48 S 2.98 $ 3.40
10023137 / 10023137 Fan Aux Windshield BB2 S 69.25
10041557 / 10041557 Filter Heater RH BB $ 10.09
1000046148 / 1099097 Blower Motor 4 Plug No WI $ 86.35 $ 151.09 $ 103.82
1000046149 / 1000046149 C-2 Blower Motor $ 110.96 $ 101.86
2587218C1 / 2587218C1 Cable Actuator Heater IC $ 10.85 $ 56.09 $ 12.56
2607910C1 / 2607910C1 Calbe Control Detent at H $ 10.00 $ 22.96 $ 14.48
RU730 / RU730 Resistor Blower Motor GMC $ 34.10




\/CC 32000022 / _ VCC 32000022 | Actuator C-2 Defrost Hea B 64.31 B 28.84 [s 80.07
Type Part Number Part Description APARTSWH| A-1TRUCK | CUMMINS | JACKSON MIDWEST STATE WIRE UNITY C&STRI
LIFT BRA 915R4312A-34YK / 915R4312A-34YKS Braun Roll Stop End Plate $ 478.32
BRA 947-0345NAKS  /  947-0345NAKS Braun Lever Roll Stop Lat $ 40.67
BRA32519KS / BRA32519KS Switch Kit C-2 Lift $ 62.72
Type Part Number Part Description APARTS WH| A-1TRUCK | CUMMINS | JACKSON MIDWEST ALT STATE WIRE ALT UNITY C&STRI
LIGHTS 007122-7K / 007122-7K Stop Arm Clutch SMC71227K | $ 111.22 $ 134.81
210002R3 / 210002R3 Marker Light No Bid
24-207 / AT44AA Light, Front Turn Signal No Bid
24-252 /| ECVML153Y Amber Side Marker Lights $ 8.07 $ 6.55
3596221C94 /I 3596221C94 Red Oval Marker Light IC S 47.33 $ 7.35
3596221C94 / ECVMLDPIR Red Oval Marker Light IC $ 7.35
4154556C1 / ECV4FPTMK Lamp Amb Turn LED Right S 185.54 $ 38.64
415455C1 / 415445C1 Lamp Amb Turn LED Left Si $ 38.95
8101-0100-30 / 8101-0100-30 License Plate Light $ 7.70
8101-0100-30 / 8102-0100-30 License Plate Light S 22.20 $ 18.27
888-504 / 888-504 Light C-2 Left Side S 170.25 S 124.83 $ 144.73
888-5109 / 888-5109 Head Light Assy IH Right $ 170.25 S 144.71 FLTHL3565430 | $ 104.80 $ 178.27
888-51110 / 888-5110 Headlight Assy Left $ 144.71 FLTHL3565429 | $ 104.80 $ 178.27
ECV7561BW-FA |/ ECV7561B2WFA 7" Clear Back-Up LED $ 102.33 $ 79.14
ECVCBLTST / ECVCBLTST LED Entry Light $ 42.27 $ 34.32
ECVCBLTST / M42321 LED Entry Light $ 42.27 $ 28.93
ECVML750GSA / 10004272 LED Amber 3/4 Round $ 5.25 $ 6.95
ECVML750GSR / 10004273 LED Red 3/4 Round $ 6.95
ECVR44B3WFA /| ECVR44B3WFA Light Back-Up $ 29.42
EVCVR12SAK / EVCVRI12SAK Stop Arm Light $ 109.00
LAMP 9006XS / LAMP 9006XS Head Lamp Low Beam $ 4.57 $ 3.60 S 11.05 | $ 9.95 | $ 7.00 | $ 4.06
LAMP 9007 / LAMP 9007 Head Light $ 3.55 $ 2.57 $ 3.18 | $ 6.50 [ $ 470 | S 2.90
Type Part Number Part Description APARTS WH| A-1 TRUCK | CUMMINS | JACKSON MIDWEST STATE WIRE UNITY C&STRI
MIRRORS 53601 / 53601 Mirror $ 105.24
62-3004 / 62-3004 Mirror $ 50.00 $ 52.30 $ 50.05
M8912FXH / M8912FXH Mirror $ 94.00 $ 47.44 S 93.51
ML1803780LB / ML180370LB Left Mirror Bracket $ 40.57 $ 67.40
Type Part Number Part Description APARTSWH| A-1 TRUCK | CUMMINS | JACKSON MIDWEST ALT STATE WIRE UNITY C&STRI
SEATS 172239-0162 | 172239-0162 Cover Seat BB 2010 Newer s 19.07 | [ S 26.42
573239-0100 / 573239-0100 Seat Cover IC Brown 7B5732390100 | $ 25.97 | S 26.42
Type Part Number Part Description APARTS WH| A-1TRUCK | CUMMINS | JACKSON MIDWEST STATE WIRE UNITY C&STRI
SUSPENSION 85920 / 85920 Shock $ 37.63
48100225 / 48100225 Height Rod Rear Air Valve $ 17.87
6127713C1 / 6127713C1 Shock International $ 87.23 $ 69.23
MO 65505 / 85991 Shock Rear BB $ 66.40 $ 66.00
MOS 34504 / MOS 34504 Shock Font Chevy 07 2500H S 51.61
MOS 34690 / MOS 34690 Shock Rear Chevy 07 2500H S 51.61
MOS 911164 / MOS 911164 Shock Rear GMC 07 HD S 61.76
MOS 911181 / MOS 911181 Shock Front GMC 2500 2010 $ 61.50
Type Part Number Part Description APARTSWH| A-1 TRUCK | CUMMINS | JACKSON MIDWEST STATE WIRE UNITY C&S TRI
SWITCHES 1124411 / 1124411 Switch Air Above Ents Door $ 11.88 15.89
10036400 / 10036400 Switch E Window BB S 21.99
00027295 / 00027295 Switch Base Warning Light $ 19.23 21.98
00027300 / 00027300 Cover Rocker W/L BB S 8.74 12.59
00027328 / 00027328 Cover Switch Service Door $ 8.26 12.59
00042458 / 00042458 Switch Base Service Door $ 25.39
04320925 / 04320925 Switch Fan BB Heater Dfro $ 8.46 6.37
24-276 / 2505670C92 Switch, Stop Lights Pres $ 51.91
4163693C91 / 4163693C91 Def Sender IC 18New $ 178.07
6121133C1 / 6121133C1 Pedal Fuel IC S 459.56
DOR 599-217 / DOR 599-217 Heater Control GMC 2500 $ 153.88 $ 130.41




DOR 669-118 /  DOR669-118 | Acc Pedal 07 GMC [s 70.30
Type Part Number Part Description APARTSWH| A-1TRUCK | CUMMINS | JACKSON MIDWEST ALT  |STATEWIRE UNITY C&STRI
WIPERS 22" Wiper Blade / 22-31 22" Wiper Blade $ 5.75 | $ 3.60 $ 3.15 $ 3.53 $ 4.76
31-18 Wiper Blade / 18-31 31-18 Blade $ 575 |$ 3.60 $ 3.15 $ 4.42 $ 4.76
31-24 Wiper Blade / 31-24 31-24 Wiper Blade $ 5.75 | $ 3.66 $ 3.15 $ 3.53 $ 4.76
31-28 Wiper Blade / 31-28 31-28 Wiper Blade $ 575 |$ 3.60 $ 3.15 $ 4.42 $ 4.76
35-220 / 35-220 Wiper Blade Ice 22" $ 1329 [$ 9.08 $ 6.49 $ 9.10 $ 13.86
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