
Students of the Month - January 
Seniors 

Liam Crafton 
Whether it's finding the little things that need to be done 
in a robotics meeting or tutoring a fellow student in the 
finer points of physics and math, Liam does an 
outstanding job. He is compassionate, helpful and 
hardworking. 

 
 

-Mr. Andresen 

Katherine Feroli 
Katherine is an incredibly dedicated language learner. 
This is evidenced by the fact that she is studying both 
AP French and Spanish. Time and again, Mrs. Ross 
and I impressed by the way she continues to excel in 
her learning. What a pleasure it has been to see her 
love for language and culture grow, as well as her 
proficiency in two world languages! She is respectful, 
kind and always has a willing attitude. 

 
-Mrs. Larwin 

Juniors  
Elgin Thompson 

Elgin is a dedicated student and meets all expectations 
with energy and commitment. He exemplifies the trait of 
personal integrity, always giving his best in every 
situation. Elgin is flexible and shows resiliency in his 
approach to learning. He is tenacious, a great leader, 
and a terrific friend. 

 
-Mrs. Evans 

America Salazar 
America will come help students in 7th period (math 
triage) on her own time. She is bilingual so she is able 
to help with math and interpret (if necessary). She is 
always positive and willing to reach out to any student 
to see if they need assistance. This is even more 
impressive as she is new to MVHS this year. 

 
-Mrs. Romero 

Sophomores  
Emmett Baumgarte 

Emmett is not afraid to challenge himself.  He works 
extremely hard inside of class and out.  Chinese is a 
difficult language and can be very difficult.  He never 
misses class and always asks for help if needed.  He is 
deserving to be recognized for his achievements and 
efforts in the classroom.   
 
-Mrs. Wu 

 

Ireland Moews 
Ireland makes teaching fun. She is constantly engaged 
in the material, smiles consistently, and challenges 
herself all the time.  

-Mr. Crum 
 

Ireland is an outstanding member of our math 
community. Ireland comes prepared every day with her 
homework completed. She even attempts the most 
difficult problems each day. Ireland is also a very active 
member of each group in math class. She works with all 
the people in her group willingly and helps others to 
learn the math as well. She has great focus and keeps 
her group discussions going with thoughtful responses 
to each prompt.  

-Mrs. Hutchison 
Freshman 

Brendan Galanaugh 
 

Brendan is the first student to arrive in my classroom 
every day.  He is never a disruption and always 
supports other students in many ways. He is gifted at 
Chinese and is a pleasure to be around.   

 
-Mrs. Wu 

Zoe Waltosz 
Zoe has such a positive attitude in and out of class. She 
is a high achiever in terms of academics and is a model 
student athlete. She was able to navigate through 
volleyball season while balancing her full academic 
schedule due to hard work and perseverance. She is 
proactive in seeking help when needed and has a great 
relationship with her peers, teachers, and coaches. She 
goes the extra mile to be kind in all she does Zoe is a 
pleasure to have in class and I am grateful to have her 
as a part of the Cougar community! 
 
-Mrs. Mottern 

 
 


