
Welcome to the CSIU Parent Portal!

Congratulations! Sharpsville Area School District has signed up to use the CSIU Parent 
Portal. This Parent Portal is a unique communication tool created for parents and 
guardians to instantly access current and important information relating to your 
child(ren)’s academic career. Through the Parent Portal, you will be able to access the 
following information:

 Schedule
 Attendance
 Discipline
 Teacher Contact Information
 Assignments and Grades
 Progress Reports, Report Cards, and more…

As well as maintaining guardian information such as:

 Name
 Phone Number
 Email and more…

To create your login, please visit our webpage at www.sharpsville.k12.pa.us and click on 
the CSIU Parent Portal link in the Forms/Links section, or go to 
https://web4.schoolport.org/plexus/parentportal/. You will need to provide an email 
address in order to register. First time users will need to go to the First Time Here? link 
located in the blue shadow box on the login page. 

Upon registration, you will need to know your child(ren)’s Student’s ID Number (found 
on students’ schedules),  Student’s Full Name, Grade Level, and Building. Families with 
multiple children will only need to know the aforementioned criteria for one student, but 
will be able to view all children in the household once registration is approved. This 
approval process will take 1-3 days.  

For your convenience, a complete learning guide can be downloaded from our website 
under the Forms/Links section. This helpful guide takes you step by step through the 
registration process as well as navigating through your child(ren)’s profile.

Attention Students!

The Student Portal is now available as well! The link for the student portal can also be 
found under the Forms/Links section of our webpage. Logins are student id numbers and
passwords are defaulted to: welcome2csiu. You will be required to change your password
upon initial login. 

If you have any problems or questions, please feel free to call Krystal Miller at 
724-962-7861 extension 1651.

http://www.sharpsville.k12.pa.us
https://web4.schoolport.org/plexus/parentportal/

