
BID TABULATION
Custodial Supplies 6/23/2009

BIDDER

Single Fold
Towels     

(9.25" x 9.25" 
Min.)

Multi Fold
Towels     

(9.25" x 9.25" 
Min.)

Toilet Paper 
2ply 500 sheet 

(4.25" wide 
Min.)

TRASH BAGS 
33" X 39"      (1.0 

Mill Min.)

TRASH BAGS 
38" X 58"       

(1.5 Mill Min.)

NON-LATEX 
EXAM GLOVES  

SMALL

NON-LATEX  
EXAM GLOVES 

MEDIUM

NON-LATEX 
EXAM GLOVES 

LARGE

NON-LATES 
EXAM GLOVES       

X LARGE
EXAM TABLE 

PAPER 21 INCH

UNIT
(4000 case) (4000 case) (96 roll case)

(master case of 
250)

(master case of 
100)

(10 -100 count 
master case)

(10 -100 count 
master case)

(10 -100 count 
master case)

(10 -100 count 
master case) (12 roll case)

BID QUANTITIES 600 350 350 175 300 5 5 5 5 20

All American Poly no bid no bid no bid $16.27 $13.19 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Central Poly Corp. $16.43 $15.99 $38.63 $14.20 $13.80 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Dyna Pak Corporation no bid no bid no bid $17.37 $17.37 no  bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Interboro Packaging Corp no bid no bid no bid $13.34 $15.32 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

JANPAK Greenville (Chad Tumblin) $14.35 not spc. $14.65 not spc. $35.65 $22.83 $16.15 $34.05 $34.05 $34.05 $34.05 $38.23 not spc.

JANPAK (State Contract) no bid no bid no bid $16.05 $11.55 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

KAMO no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

O' Sullivan Janitorial Corp. $14.99 $13.98 $25.95 $23.30 $15.15 $36.95 $36.95 $36.95 $36.95 $39.99

Office Church School Supply Co. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Pyramid School Products no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $35.90 $35.90 $35.90 $35.90 no bid

Quill no bid no bid $47.51 no bid no bid no bid $42.90 $42.90 no bid $28.10

School Specialty no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $95.88

Smith & Jones Distributing Co. $16.05 $14.90 $28.00 $10.32 $17.00 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00

Southeastern Paper Group $14.53 $14.26 $32.90 $22.68 $23.03 $33.99 $33.99 $33.99 $33.99 no bid

Todd Distributing $15.20 $14.65 $25.95 $9.60 $16.00 $33.80 $33.80 $33.80 $33.80 $32.80

Unipak Corp no bid no bid no bid $9.15 $13.15 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Western Carolina Products $13.98 $13.97 $24.97 $23.49 $14.98 $33.15 $33.15 $33.15 $33.15 $32.98

XPEDEX (State Contract) $12.86 $12.50 $27.84 $27.71 $23.44 $39.77 $39.77 $39.77 $39.77 no bid

BID ADJUSTMENTS
JANPAC St.Cont. (38"x58" 200 c/s) $23.10
JANPAC Greenville (33"x40" 150 c/s) $13.70
O' Sullivan Janitorial Corp.( 33"x39" 100 c/s) $9.32
XPEDEX St. Contract (+ pallet Chg. $7.50) $12.73 $12.37 $27.65


