BID REQUEST 20-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.

BID FORM
1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10
Vito Bass Alto Tenor Sax Bass Bass Clarinet
Clarinet Saxophone | Tenro Sax Alto Sax Ligature & Clarinet Clarinet Clarinet Ligature &
BIDDERS Mouthpiece | Mouthpiece | Ligature cap Mouthpiece | Ligature | Mouthpiece Cap Reeds 2.0

ARTS MUSIC SHOP $1,699.99(|no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
_no bid $28.00 $30.00 $24.00 $24.00 $34.00 $24.00 $32.50 $22.00 $30.00
MUSIC & ARTS CORP. $1,618.00 $28.00 $30.00 $23.00 $17.00 $37.00 $18.00 $32.00 $18.00 $34.00
PLAYGROUND MUSIC CENTER 3%LP $1,779.79 $21.51 $22.23 $19.70 $19.70 $28.64 $19.70 $25.73 $19.70 $36.43
TAYLOR MUSIC no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
UNIVERSAL MELODY $1,581.00(no bid no bid $24.00 $23.00{no bid $21.00{no bid $21.00 $33.00
WENGER CORP. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid




BID REQUEST 20-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.

BID FORM
11 12 13 14 15 16 17 18 19 20
Bass Soprano
Reeds Bass | Reeds Alto | Reeds Bari Clarinet Clarinet- JSoprano Sax] Tenor Sax Clarinet-
BIDDERS Reeds 3.0 | Reeds 3.5 3/0 3.0 Sax 3.0 [ Mouthpiece Ebony - Gold Mouthpiece Ebony
ARTS MUSIC SHOP no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $4,399.00 $1,879.59(no bid $439.99
_ $30.00 $30.00 $24.00 $40.00 $30.00 $90.00|no bid no bid no bid no bid
MUSIC & ARTS CORP. $34.00 $34.00 $27.00 $46.00 $33.00 $87.00 $4,163.00 $1,750.00 $136.00 $416.00
PLAYGROUND MUSIC CENTER 3%LP $36.43 $36.43 $29.43 $49.43 $37.43 $71.97 $4,578.20 $1,930.95 $124.74 $460.00
3% win
TAYLOR MUSIC no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $1,744.00|no bid $366.00
UNIVERSAL MELODY $33.00 $33.00 $27.00 $53.00 $38.00 $73.00 $4,067.00|no bid $124.00|no bid
WENGER CORP. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid




BID REQUEST 20-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.

BID FORM
21 22 23 24 25 26 27 28 29 30
Flute
w/Offset- Alto Flute - | Bass Flute -| Alto Sax - Piccolo - Clarinet - Bb Clarinet

BIDDERS Silver Silver Silver Brass Piccolo Silver Wood Bari Sax w/case |Flute wicase

ARTS MUSIC SHOP $419.99 $2,099.00 $2,299.00 $1,839.99 $619.99|no bid $849.99|no bid no bid no bid

_no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
MUSIC & ARTS CORP. $396.00 $2,043.00 $2,375.00 $1,714.00 $571.00 $405.00 $807.00 $3,240.00 $781.00 $944.00
PLAYGROUND MUSIC CENTER 3%LP $439.43 $2,046.98 $2,262.23 $1,891.05 $635.00 $1,093.00 $890.40 $3,422.29 $693.96 $989.17

TAYLOR MUSIC $344.00 $1,944.00 $2,188.00 $1,711.00 $566.00|no bid S744.00|no bid $770.00|no bid

UNIVERSAL MELODY no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $719.00|no bid $3,147.00 $819.00|no bid

WENGER CORP. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid




BID REQUEST 20-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.

BID FORM
31 32 33 34 35 36 37 38 39 40
Cornet Bb clarinet - Clarinet Clarinet Clarinet Clarinet Sax 3.5 Alto Alto Sax Alto Sax
BIDDERS w/case silver Mouthpiece | Reeds 3.0 | Reeds 3.5 | Reeds 3.0 Reeds Saxophone | Mouthpiece | Reeds 3.5

ARTS MUSIC SHOP $598.00 $1,399.99(no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $2,379.00(no bid no bid
_no bid no bid $90.00 $26.00 $24.00 $20.00 $24.00|no bid $125.00 $29.00
MUSIC & ARTS CORP. $562.00 $1,311.00 $87.00 $21.00 $21.00 $20.00 $21.00 $2,178.00 $112.00 $27.00
PLAYGROUND MUSIC CENTER 3%LP $623.55 $1,446.90 $71.97 $19.42 $19.42 $18.12 $18.96 $2,402.46 $99.41 $24.07
TAYLOR MUSIC $539.00 $1,313.00(no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $2,288.00|no bid no bid
UNIVERSAL MELODY no bid no bid $75.00 $26.00 $26.00 $23.00 $28.00{no bid $112.00 $29.00
WENGER CORP. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid




BID REQUEST 20-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.

BID FORM
41 42 43 44 45 46 47 48 49 50
Bari Sax
Tenor Sax | Tenor Sax Bari Sax Ligature - Bari Sax Hercules Trumpet JFrench Horn

BIDDERS Mouthpiece Reeds Mouthpiece Gold Reeds Stands |Tuba - Silver] Mouthpiece | mouthpiece | Tuba wi/case
ARTS MUSIC SHOP no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $3,499.00(no bid no bid $1,869.00

_ $150.00 $24.00 $240.00 $52.00 $37.00 $65.00|no bid $46.00 $122.00|no bid
MUSIC & ARTS CORP. $109.00 $20.00 $235.00 $39.00 $35.00 $64.00 $3,765.00 $52.00 $57.00 $2,100.00
PLAYGROUND MUSIC CENTER 3%LP $133.61 $18.14 $212.28 $49.97 $31.47 $50.12 $4,011.79 S44.16 $56.89 $2,116.98

TAYLOR MUSIC no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

UNIVERSAL MELODY $136.00 $23.00 $220.00 $32.00 $48.00 $81.00(no bid $54.00 $53.00(no bid

WENGER CORP. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid




BID REQUEST 20-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.

BID FORM
51 52 53 54 55 56 57 58 59 60
Euphonium Marching
w/ case - Trombone | Tuba Rest -} Trombone Dbl French | Mellophone- JRotary Tuba
BIDDERS Tuba w/case Brass Tuba stand w/case black wicase [ Tuba - Gold Horn Gold Gold

ARTS MUSIC SHOP $2,639.00 $1,398.00(no bid $579.00|no bid $779.00 $2,799.00 $2,699.00 $939.00 $6,199.00

_no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
MUSIC & ARTS CORP. $3,697.00 $1,344.00(no bid $916.00|no bid $977.00 $2,687.00 $2,480.00 $1,094.00 $5,998.00
PLAYGROUND MUSIC CENTER 3%LP $3,006.93 $1,482.60 $360.00 $635.52 $67.50 $864.18 $2,964.15 $2,727.23 $1,294.88 $6,616.05
TAYLOR MUSIC no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $2,666.00|no bid $1,030.00 $5,988.00

UNIVERSAL MELODY no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $2,524.00|no bid no bid

WENGER CORP. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid




BID REQUEST 20-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.

BID FORM
61 62 63 64 65 66 67 68 69 70
Trumpet Trumpet -
Wow Wow -] Trumpet - }| Trombone - Silver & | Trombone - Trombone - JEuphonium -
BIDDERS Alum Gold Silver Gold Brass Tuba - Gold Brass Silver Tuba Tuba
ARTS MUSIC SHOP no bid $619.99 $629.99 $1,059.00 $1,099.00 $3,459.00(no bid $2,269.00 $4,889.99 $1,779.00
silver
_no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
MUSIC & ARTS CORP. $34.00 $562.00 $562.00 $1,086.00 $1,008.00 $5,189.00(no bid $3,894.00 $4,508.00 $2,100.00
PLAYGROUND MUSIC CENTER 3%LP $32.83 $620.55 $599.97 $1,093.05 $1,410.15 $4,011.74 $1,811.04 $2,583.96 $4,967.55 $2,016.07
TAYLOR MUSIC no bid S477.00|no bid $999.00|no bid no bid no bid no bid $4,449.00|no bid
gold/brass
UNIVERSAL MELODY $37.00|no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
WENGER CORP. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid




BID REQUEST 20-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.

BID FORM
71 72 73 74 75 76 77 78 79 80
Silent Brass
Trombone - Trombone | Euphonium § Tuba Case Clarinet - Trumpet trumpet system for
BIDDERS Rose bell | 3/4 Tuba Stand w/case w/wheels Tuba Silver mouthpiece | mouthpiece | Trumpet
ARTS MUSIC SHOP $2,179.99 $1,859.99(no bid $1,869.00 $5,639.99 $1,399.99(no bid no bid no bid
_no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $60.00 $55.00 $200.00
MUSIC & ARTS CORP. $2,070.00 $2,100.00 $25.00 $1,769.00 $5,189.00 $1,311.00 $52.00 $52.00 $150.00
PLAYGROUND MUSIC CENTER 3%LP $2,189.46 $2,116.98 $33.99 $1,945.78 $5,706.67 $1,446.90 $42.34 $42.34 $167.87
TAYLOR MUSIC no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $1,313.00(|no bid no bid no bid
UNIVERSAL MELODY $2,023.00{no bid $42.00 $1,729.00 $5,272.00(|no bid $48.00 $48.00|no bid
WENGER CORP. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid




BID REQUEST 20-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.

BID FORM
81 82 83 84 85 86 87 88 89 90
silent brass Ext &
Silent Brass tenor tenor system for | silent brass Silent brass Resistance
French Horn] System for | trombone trombone tenor system for Tuba system for JSousaphone] Piece for
BIDDERS mouthpiece | French Horn] mouthpiece | mouthpiece | trombone | euphonium | mouthiece Tuba Bits - Silver | Trumpet
ARTS MUSIC SHOP no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
_ $65.00 $225.00 $72.00 $80.00|no bid no bid $85.00 $750.00(no bid $15.00
MUSIC & ARTS CORP. $47.00 $172.00 $66.00 $68.00 $165.00 $264.00 $69.00 $460.00 $65.00 $15.00
PLAYGROUND MUSIC CENTER 3%LP $43.16 $196.87 $62.06 $51.99 $184.87 $184.87 $53.11 $497.87 $61.84 $19.24
3% win
TAYLOR MUSIC no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
UNIVERSAL MELODY $41.00|no bid $61.00 $61.00|no bid no bid $64.00|no bid no bid $12.00
WENGER CORP. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid




BID REQUEST 20-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.

BID FORM
91 92 93 94 95 96 97 98 99 100
Ext & Ext & Ext & Ext & Ext &
Resistance | Resistance | Resistance | resistance | Resistance | Trumpet/ Hercules Adams
Piece for Piece for piece for piece for Piece for Cornet Stands for | Trombone Adams Xylophone
BIDDERS Cornet  |French Horn] trombone.. | trombone Tuba Stands  |French Horn Stand Chimes wiframe
ARTS MUSIC SHOP no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $3,199.99 $3,999.99
_ $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $26.00 $30.00 $25.00|no bid no bid
MUSIC & ARTS CORP. $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $24.00 $27.00 $19.00 $3,074.00 $2,304.00
PLAYGROUND MUSIC CENTER 3%LP $17.24 $19.24 $14.00 $14.00 $14.00 $25.00 $28.00 $24.00 $3,362.00 $2,520.00
TAYLOR MUSIC no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $2,992.00 $2,233.00
UNIVERSAL MELODY $12.00 $12.00 $12.00 $12.00 $12.00 $41.00 $41.00 $31.00 $3,074.00 $2,304.00
WENGER CORP. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid




BID REQUEST 20-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.

BID FORM
101 102 103 104 105 106 107 108 109 110
Yamaha
Symphonic | FL Clave | Bass Drum | Marimba ] Ridge Rider] Drum Bag Snare Drum { Snare Drum J Drum Mount
BIDDERS Bells Grenadilla |Mallet holder] Mallets Cowbell Set Cymbal Pair black Case carriers

ARTS MUSIC SHOP $1,789.99(|no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

_no bid $21.00|no bid $38.00 $55.00|no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
MUSIC & ARTS CORP. $1,631.00 $18.00 $69.00 $31.00 $42.00 $99.00 $89.00 $199.00 $79.00 $37.00
PLAYGROUND MUSIC CENTER 3%LP $1,799.00 $19.00 $52.00 $30.00 $41.00 $135.00 $120.00 $225.00 $85.00 $41.00
TAYLOR MUSIC no bid no bid S44.00(no bid no bid no bid no bid $193.00 $74.00 $36.00
UNIVERSAL MELODY no bid $21.00 $50.00 $34.00 $55.00{no bid $107.00 $207.00 $79.00 $37.00

WENGER CORP. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid




BID REQUEST 20-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.

BID FORM
111 112 113 114 115 116 117 118 119 120
Marching Cymbal Marching | Bass Drum | Bass Drum | Sleigh Bells Chime 18x14 Bass | 20x14 Bass | 22x14 Bass
BIDDERS Cymbals |leather pads| Bass Drum Case Cover on Handle | Hammer Drum Drum Drum
ARTS MUSIC SHOP no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $469.99 $499.99 $519.99
_ $130.00 $13.00|no bid no bid no bid $48.00 $40.00|no bid no bid no bid
MUSIC & ARTS CORP. no bid $13.00 $261.00 $82.00 $45.00 $25.00 $29.00 $451.00 $484.00 $501.00
PLAYGROUND MUSIC CENTER 3%LP [no bid $12.00 $295.00 $95.00 $53.00 $29.00 $25.00 $499.00 $525.00 $545.00
TAYLOR MUSIC no bid no bid $255.00 $78.00 $43.00{no bid no bid $439.00 $470.00 $486.00
UNIVERSAL MELODY $111.00 $20.00 $261.00 $83.00 $46.00{no bid $45.00 $490.00 $537.00 $552.00
WENGER CORP. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid




BID REQUEST 20-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.

BID FORM
121 122 123 124 125 126 127 128 129 130
24x14 Bass 18" Bass 20" Bass 22" Bass 24" Bass Marching Marching Marching
BIDDERS Drum Bass Stand | Drum Case | Drum Case | Drum Case | Drum Case | Multi-Toms | Tenor Stand] Tenor Case | Snare Drum
ARTS MUSIC SHOP $529.99 $149.00 $87.00 $102.00 $110.00 $123.00 $1,672.00 $150.00 $148.00 $470.00
_no bid $300.00|no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
MUSIC & ARTS CORP. $516.00 $145.00 $86.00 $99.00 $105.00 $117.00 $984.00 $145.00 $144.00 $527.00
PLAYGROUND MUSIC CENTER 3%LP $565.00 $160.00 $99.00 $110.00 $120.00 $132.00 $1,065.00 $165.00 $165.00|no bid
TAYLOR MUSIC $501.00 $160.00 $82.00 $96.00 $103.00 $115.00 $955.00 $162.00 $140.00 $439.00
UNIVERSAL MELODY $570.00 $149.00 $87.00 $102.00 $110.00 $123.00 $984.00 $150.00 $148.00 $451.00
WENGER CORP. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid




BID REQUEST 20-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.

BID FORM
131 132 133 134 135 136 137 138 139 140 141
Marching Susp. Field Frame
Snare 18" Crash | Suspended] Cymbal Cumbal JQuint drumsjSnare Drum Tenor Bass Drum | w/damper
BIDDERS Stand Cymbals | Cymbals Cymbal Holder cradle - blue Carrier Carrier Carrier pedal
ARTS MUSIC SHOP $134.00|no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $209.00 $237.00 $218.00 $3,699.99
_ $240.00 $145.00 $205.00(no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
MUSIC & ARTS CORP. $133.00 $160.00 $199.00 $199.00(no bid no bid $1,077.00 $200.00 $227.00 $209.00 $3,559.00
PLAYGROUND MUSIC CENTER 3%LP $150.00 $220.00 $205.00 $205.00(no bid no bid $1,225.00 $225.00 $255.00 $235.00 $3,850.00
TAYLOR MUSIC $144.00|no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $195.00 $222.00 $203.00 $3,449.00
UNIVERSAL MELODY $134.00 $154.00 $383.00 $192.00|no bid no bid no bid $209.00 $237.00 $218.00| $35,559.00
WENGER CORP. no bid no bid no bid no bid $203.00 $165.00(no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid




BID REQUEST 20-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.

BID FORM
142 143 144 145 146 147 148 149 150 151 152
Cymbal Enduro
Xylophone | Pipe Clamp boom Crash Field Drum | Bass Drum Case Eduro Case] 10"Tom

BIDDERS w/frame | w/adjjaw | holder/arm | Cymbals 14x12 Case |Snare Drum| w/foam |Snare Drum| w/foam [Drum Head

ARTS MUSIC SHOP $3,999.99(no bid no bid no bid $619.00(no bid $467.00[no bid $548.00|no bid no bid
_no bid $30.00 $60.00|no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $10.00
MUSIC & ARTS CORP. $2,304.00 $24.00 $31.00 $595.00 $594.00 $74.00 $448.00(no bid $472.00[no bid $13.00
PLAYGROUND MUSIC CENTER 3%LP $5,520.00 $24.38 $35.12 $927.99 $599.87 $101.81 $462.87 $99.87 $512.87 $92.87 $12.99

TAYLOR MUSIC $2,233.00 $24.99 $31.99|no bid $577.00|no bid $435.00|no bid no bid no bid no bid
UNIVERSAL MELODY $2,304.00 $22.00 $28.00|no bid $595.00(no bid $449.00 $105.00 $473.00 $125.00 $13.00

WENGER CORP. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid




BID REQUEST 20-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.

BID FORM
153 154 155 156 157 158 159 160 161 162 163
20
12" Tom 13" Tom 14" Tom 14" Side Clear Drum JCymbal Pairj Suspended | 16" Cymbal] 14" Snare | 14" Snare
BIDDERS Drum Head | Drum Head | Drum Head | Drum Head | Drum Set Set 19" Cymbal pair Drum Drum
ARTS MUSIC SHOP no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
_ $10.50 $11.00 $11.00 $11.00 $30.00 $26.00 $375.00 $320.00 $460.00
MUSIC & ARTS CORP. $14.00 $15.00 $16.00 $15.00 $42.00 $35.00 $259.00 $299.00 $433.00 $50.00 $50.00
PLAYGROUND MUSIC CENTER 3%LP $13.12 $14.49 $14.99 $13.99 $31.27 $31.27 $542.87 $438.87 $643.87 $35.89 $34.19
TAYLOR MUSIC no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
UNIVERSAL MELODY $14.00 $14.50 $15.00 $15.00 $43.00 $36.00 $351.00 $303.00 $440.00 $43.00 $42.00
WENGER CORP. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid




BID REQUEST 20-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.

BID FORM
164 165 166 167 168 169 170 171 172 173 174
16" 18" 20" 22" 24"
Marching Marching Marching Marching Marching Kross 88-

Tenor Drum] Bass Drum | Bass Drum | Bass Drum | Bass Drum | Bass Drum | Tom Trim - | Tom Trim key ess

BIDDERS Head Pack | Heads Heads Heads Heads Heads 15 ft End Bracket] Trap Table | Melodica bundle
ARTS MUSIC SHOP no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

_ $60.00 $30.00 $32.00 $35.00 $36.00 $41.00|no bid no bid $150.00 $65.00|  $1,350.00
MUSIC & ARTS CORP. no bid $43.00 $47.00 $50.00 $55.00 $59.00 $15.00 $4.00(no bid no bid no bid
PLAYGROUND MUSIC CENTER 3%LP [no bid $37.87 $34.31 $43.87 $47.87 $54.87 $19.87 $4.75 $143.87 $84.87|no bid
3% win

TAYLOR MUSIC no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $14.99 $4.99(no bid no bid no bid
UNIVERSAL MELODY no bid $39.00 $41.00 $49.00 $50.00 $54.00 $15.00(|no bid $140.00|no bid no bid
WENGER CORP. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid




BID REQUEST 20-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.

BID FORM
175 176 177 178 179 180 181 182 183 184 185
Vibraphone Podium AV Install for
Yamaha fram Yamaha | Transport Speakers - |Subwoofer -} Receiver - stereo/
BIDDERS Fretboard | 14" Djembe| w/motor | keyboard Kit Stand Cart | Chair Cart Blk blk bik cabinetry
ARTS MUSIC SHOP no bid no bid no bid $999.00(no bid no bid no bid
lEmzvuscco.sEie|  sssoo0]  $300.00|nobie $1,500.00(nobid___ |nobid___|nobid
MUSIC & ARTS CORP. no bid $241.00 $3,909.00{no bid $857.00(no bid no bid
PLAYGROUND MUSIC CENTER 3%LP $328.04|no bid $4,293.00 $995.00(no bid $317.00 $207.00
TAYLOR MUSIC no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
UNIVERSAL MELODY no bid $264.00 $3,819.00(|no bid no bid no bid no bid
WENGER CORP. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $472.00 $409.00




BID REQUEST 20-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.

BID FORM
186 187 188 189 190 191 192 193 194 195 196
Music
Marching Directo's | Library Ext | Director's Foldable

Tenor [Tech Bridge] w/installatio] Combo Fix | Seating Equipment JColor GuardjColor Guard] Aluminum

BIDDERS MakeMusic practice pad] System n Kit Dolly Floor tarp Cart Rifle Sabre Flag Pole
ARTS MUSIC SHOP no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
MUSIC & ARTS CORP. $179.00(no bid no bid no bid no bid
PLAYGROUND MUSIC CENTER 3%LP no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
TAYLOR MUSIC no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
UNIVERSAL MELODY no bid no bid no bid $495.00(no bid

WENGER CORP. no bid $855.00 $3,726.00(no bid $343.00




BID REQUEST 20-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.

BID FORM
197 198 199 200 201 202 203
Sound Notation
Digital Machine Board Mobile [Repair/Refu
Parade | 10' Parade | Banner w/2 w/Stave | Reversible Jrbins (hourly] GRAND
BIDDERS Banner Banner Stand headsets lines Whiteboard rate) TOTAL
ARTS MUSIC SHOP no bid no bid
no bid no bid
MUSIC & ARTS CORP. no bid no bid
PLAYGROUND MUSIC CENTER 3%LP no bid 65.00 hr
TAYLOR MUSIC no bid no bid
UNIVERSAL MELODY no bid no bid
WENGER CORP. $1,338.00 no bid




