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“I cannot change history, 
math, or science, but I can 

change students and        
recipes.” 

~ Mr. Dailey 
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 ServSafe Food Handler Certification 

 ServSafe Manager Certification 

 ServSafe Instructor Certification 

Join FCCLA 
Family, Career and Community Leaders 
of America (FCCLA) is a dynamic and 
effective  national  student  organization 
that helps young men and women become   
leaders and address important personal, 
family, work and  societal issues through 
Family and  Consumer Sciences Education 
as determined by the state department of 
education. FCCLA has over 150,000  
members and more than 5,300 chapters 
from 48 state associations, Puerto Rico, 
and the Virgin Islands.                           

The organization has involved more than 
10 million people since its founding in 
1945. The Ultimate Leadership              
Experience is unique among youth        
organizations because its programs are 
planned and run by   members. It is the 
only career and technical in-school student 
organization with family as its central   
focus. Participation in national programs 
and chapter activities helps members     
become strong leaders in their families, 
careers and communities. 

This program is centered around    

students who have an interest in    

pursuing careers in nutrition,        

wellness, and health and disease     

prevention. Courses provide students 

with knowledge in event planning, 

photographic styling applications,   

social media and digital design     

techniques, developing and adapting 

food products for marketing and    

specific nutrition needs, meal       

planning, food safety, and the          

scientific investigation of  production, 

processing, preparation, evaluation, 

and utilization of  food.  

Contact Us: 

Gadsden City High School 

1917 Black Creek Parkway 
Gadsden, AL 35904 

(256) 543-3614 

mjdailey@gcs.k12.al.us 

 Event Planning 

 Food Innovations and Media 

 Sports Nutrition 


